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Austin Aldag is a junior Political Science major with minors in History and Economics. 
In his time at Illinois Wesleyan, Austin served as the Treasurer and then the President of 
Student Senate, has been involved with the Book Bike as a part of the West Bloomington 
Revitalization Project, and is currently a research assistant for the Political Science 
Department. He is also involved in the IWU Bike Committee and was awarded a grant 
from the Todd Zoellick Fellowship to implement a Bike Co-op on campus. Austin spent 
the summer of 2012 interning on Capitol Hill for Congressman William L. Enyart, and he 
is currently looking forward to returning to Washington DC this upcoming summer to 
work as a Junior Fellow at the JPSM (Joint Program in Survey Methodology) at the 
University of Maryland. 
 
 
Annie Kehler is a senior Political Science major, minor in Theatre Arts. Originally a 
theatre major, she has strived to use the arts and creativity to create social and political 
change. During her time at IWU, she served as President and Co-Founder of Creativity 
for Change, Producer/Director of the annual Student Choreographed Dance Concert, and 
on the Executive Board of the IWU College Democrats. She also served as a Traditional 
Media Coordinator and Deputy Communications Director for College Democrats of 
America, and Communications Director of College Democrats of Illinois. She has held 
internships with Governor John Hickenlooper of Colorado, the Human Rights Campaign, 
the Hickenlooper for Colorado campaign, and the Ann Callis for Congress campaign. 
After graduation she hopes to continue working on campaigns and pursuing progressive 
causes.  
 
 
Casey Plach is a senior Political Science major and Spanish minor. Throughout her time 
at IWU she has worked as a writing center tutor, a research assistant for the Political 
Science department, and a residential community advisor. Casey has also interned at 
State Farm, Heartland Head Start, and the McLean County Law and Justice Center. Some 
of her most influential college experiences included volunteering at The Immigration 
Project in Bloomington, IL and studying abroad in Granada, Spain. Casey is currently 
working for an immigration law firm in downtown Chicago. 
 
 
Daniel Truesdale is a senior Political Science and Economics double major. At IWU, 
Daniel has been a constant staple in the Economics lab assisting professors and students 
alike. Daniel also partook in the Washington D.C. semester program through American 
University, interning at the American Enterprise Institute (AEI). He has also interned for 
several political campaigns and for the City of Bloomington. After IWU, Daniel will be 
continuing his education in a Masters of Public Policy at either the University of Chicago 
or Georgetown University. 
 
 



RES PUBLICA v 
	
  

Mike Kistner is a senior Political Science major and English minor at Illinois Wesleyan. 
He has been fortunate enough to participate in numerous political science endeavors 
including editing Res Publica, working in the Scottish Parliament, and conducting 
original research as part of the Eckley Summer Scholars and Artist endowment. Mike is 
an inducted member of the Epsilon Gamma chapter of Sigma Pi at IWU, and in his spare 
time enjoys cheering for the St. Louis Blues and going to concerts and music festivals. 
His future plans are continuing his education in a political science PhD program at 
Princeton University, with a focus on studying legislative politics at the state level. 
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